GOVERNMENT OF KERALA
Transport (B) Department
NOTIFICATION

G.0.(P) N0.99/2013/Tran. Dated, Thiruvananthapuram, 22™ October, 2013.

§

S.R.O. No. /2013.- In exercise of the powers conferred by clauses
(c¢) & (k) of sub section (2) of section 28, clause (f) of sub - section (2) of
section 38, clause (f) of sub section (2) of section 65, and clause (vii) of
sub-section (2) of section 96 of the Motor Vehicles Act, 1988, the
Government of Kerala hereby make the following rules further to amend
the Kerala Motor Vehicles Rules, 1989, and the same having been
previously published as notification No. 896/B2/2013/Tran dated 5"
August, 2013, in the Kerala Gazette Extraordinary No. 2404 dated 20"
August 2013, as required under sub — section 1 of section 212 of the said

Act, namely :-

RULES

I Short title and commencement - (1) These rules may be called

the Kerala Motor Vehicles ( 11" Amendment) Rules, 2013
(2)  They shall come into force on and from the first day of

November, 2013.

2. Amendment of the Rules.- In the Kerala Motor Vehicles Rules,
1989,-

(1)  in rule 34, for the words “two hundred rupees” the words
“five hundred rupees” shall be substituted ;

(i)  in rule 79 for the words “fifty rupees” the words “two hundred

rupees” shall be substituted ;




(iii) in sub - rule (6) of rule 94 for the words “fifty rupees” the
words “one hundred rupees” shall be substituted ;
(iv) for the table shown below in rule 102 the following table shall

be substituted, namely:-

Amount
Period of delay Transport Non-Transport
Vehicles Vehicles

(a) In case the period of delay does not

exceed three months 200 100
(b) In case the period of delay exceeds

three months but does not exceed 300 200

six months
(c) In case the period of delay exceeds

six months 500 300

(v)  for the existing rule 164 the following shall be substituted,

namely :-

“164. Application fee for permit. - The fee in respect of an application

L]

for grant or renewal of a permit shall be -

Permit Temporary Permit

(a) Contract carriages ) €9
(i) Autorickshaw, Motorised

Cycle Rickshaw 300 Nil

(ii) Motor cab 700 Nil

(1i1) Maxi cab 2000 200
(iv) Contract carriage having

(1) 13- 20 seats 3000 300

(2) more than 20 seats 3500 500

(b) Private service vehicle permit 1000 Nil

(c) Goods carriage
(i) LGV 1000 250
(ii) Others 1500 400

(d) Stage carriage 5500 Nil




(i) Temporary permit under
clauses (a) and (b) of sub-
section (1) of section 87 of 250
the Act
(ii) Temporary permit under
clause (c¢)of sub- section(1)
of section 87 of the Act 500

(e) Special permit under sub-
section (8) of section 88 of

the Act
(i) for stage carriages 500
(ii) for other types of Public

Service Vehicles 250

Provided that no fee shall be charged for a temporary permit issued
under section 87 (d) of the Act” ;

(vi) in sub — rule (1) of rule 234, for the words “one thousand
rupees in the case of a tourist motor cab and two thousand rupees in the
case of a tourist omni bus” the words “one thousand and five hundred
rupees in the case of a tourist motor cab and two thousand and five
hundred rupees in the case of a tourist omni bus” shall be substituted ;

(vii) in sub - rule (1) of rule 235, for the words, “one thousand
and five hundred rupees” the words “two thousand and five hundred

rupees” shall be substituted.

By order of the Governor,

DR.V.M. GOPALA MENON IAS,
Secretary to Government.




Explanatory Note

(This does not form part of the notification, but is intended to
indicate its general purport.)

The State Government is empowered under Sections '28,38,65 & 96
of the Motor Vehicles Act, 1988 to levy the fee of services like sanctioning
permit, registration of vehicles, renewal of permit, issue of duplicate
Registration Certificate, issue of duplicate driving licence, issue of
duplicate conductor licence etc. for which periodic rate enhancements shall
be made. The rates of several such services are still nominal, which were
fixed years ago.

Now, Government have decided to enhance the fee for such services
by amending Rules 34, 79, 94(6), 102, 164, 234(1) & 235(1) of Kerala
Motor Vehicles Rules 1989.

The notification is intended to achieve the above object.




